
From: @dft.gov.uk>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 18, 2024 9:26 AM 
To: Patrick Doig @tfl.gov.uk> 
Cc: @dft.gov.uk>;  

@dft.gov.uk> 
Subject: RE: EL Contract - first milestone 

 
Hi Patrick, 
  
Thanks for this, I can confirm nothing further needed and we have instructed the 
payment to be made on 01 July for £33.1m as per the funding letter. 
  
Any issues, let me know. 
  
Thanks, 
 

 
  

   London Partnerships and Delivery; Regions, 

Cities and Devolution Directorate; Roads and Local Group, , Department for Transport 

    
Post to: Great Minster Hse, 33 Horseferry Rd, London, SW1P 4DR    
From: Patrick Doig @tfl.gov.uk>  
Sent: Monday, June 17, 2024 10:22 AM 
To: @dft.gov.uk> 
Subject: EL Contract - first milestone 
  

 
  
We met our first milestone on the Alstom contract variation on Friday - notice to 
proceed. Alstom have invoiced us (attached) which we will pay within 10 working days. 
  
Do you need any further evidence to process the payment on your end? 
 
Thanks 
Patrick 
  

Patrick Doig (he/him) 

Group Finance Director 

Mobile:  | Email: @tfl.gov.uk 
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